

VICTORIA COUNTY, TEXAS						
BID CHECK LIST FOR ROAD MATERIALS - ASPHALTIC MATERIALS - EFFECTIVE APRIL 1, 2021						
	Asphalt, Type AC-15P	Asphalt, Type MC-30	Asphalt, Type CRS2 Emulsions	Asphalt, Type CRS2-P Emulsions	Pump and Hose	Demurrage
Company Name	Bid Price	Bid Price	Bid Price	Bid Price	Charge	Charge
<u>Cleveland Asphalt Products, Inc. Phone #800-334-0177</u>						
Precinct #1	NO BID	\$4.60/Gal	\$2.65/Gal	\$3.25/Gal	No Charge	\$80/Hr after 2 hrs
Precinct #2	NO BID	\$4.60/Gal	\$2.65/Gal	\$3.25/Gal	No Charge	
Precinct #3	NO BID	\$4.60/Gal	\$2.65/Gal	\$3.25/Gal	No Charge	
Precinct #4	NO BID	\$4.60/Gal	\$2.65/Gal	\$3.25/Gal	No Charge	
Note: All prices based on minimum 5000 gallon load. Call for smaller quantities						
<u>Ergon Asphalt #512-469-9292</u>						
Precinct #1	\$3.71/Gal (a)	NO BID	\$2.98/Gal (a)	\$3.48/Gal (a)	\$90/Load	\$90/Hr after 2 hrs
Precinct #2	\$3.71/Gal (a)	NO BID	\$2.98/Gal (a)	\$3.48/Gal (a)	\$90/Load	\$90/Hr after 2 hrs
Precinct #3	\$3.71/Gal (a)	NO BID	\$2.98/Gal (a)	\$3.48/Gal (a)	\$90/Load	\$90/Hr after 2 hrs
Precinct #4	\$3.71/Gal (a)	NO BID	\$2.98/Gal (a)	\$3.48/Gal (a)	\$90/Load	\$90/Hr after 2 hrs
Note: This bid is for full transport loads of 5,500 gallons. Freight is based on a full transport load, even if a load of material is not ordered. Return freight one-half of the outgoing tariff. For equipment ordered, but not used, carrier may charge up to \$400.00.						
Note: Prices will be firm throughout 2022						
<u>Martin Asphalt Company #713-350-6852</u>						
Precinct #1	\$3.48/Gal (b)	\$3.33/Gal (b)	\$2.63/Gal (b)	\$2.93/Gal (b)	No Charge	\$70/Hr after 2 hrs
Precinct #2	\$3.48/Gal (b)	\$3.33/Gal (b)	\$2.63/Gal (b)	\$2.93/Gal (b)	No Charge	\$70/Hr after 2 hrs
Precinct #3	\$3.48/Gal (b)	\$3.33/Gal (b)	\$2.63/Gal (b)	\$2.93/Gal (b)	No Charge	\$70/Hr after 2 hrs
Precinct #4	\$3.48/Gal (b)	\$3.33/Gal (b)	\$2.63/Gal (b)	\$2.93/Gal (b)	No Charge	\$70/Hr after 2 hrs
<u>Valero Phone # N/A</u>						
Precinct #1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Precinct #2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Precinct #3	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Precinct #4	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Note: Currently not quoting firm prices on asphalt products but will sell on a daily rack basis. FOB Valero - Corpus Christit current daily rack prices: MC-30 - \$915/ton, AC-15P - \$755/ton, CRS2 - No Bid, CRS2-P - No Bid						
(a) Terms: Net 0% 30 days, Delivery in 1 day						
(b) Terms: Net 0% 30 days, Delivery in 3 days						