

| VICTORIA COUNTY, TEXAS | | | | | |
|---|-----------------------------------|-----------------------------------|-------------------------|------------------------------------|----------------------------|
| BID CHECKLIST FOR ROAD MATERIALS - PROCESSED BASE, CRUSHED LIMESTON BASE, TYPE II PORTLAND CEMENT & AGGREGATE FOR SURFACE TREATMENT - EFFECTIVE APRIL 1, 2021 | | | | | |
| | Gravel-Processed Flexible Base | Crushed Limestone Base | Type II Portland Cement | Surface Treatment Aggregate | Aggregate Type PE, Grade 4 |
| Company Name | Type B, Grade 3 Bid Price Item #1 | Type A, Grade 4 Bid Price Item #2 | Bid Price Item #3 | Type PB, Grade 4 Bid Price Item #4 | Bid Price Item #5 |
| ABN Construction, LLC Phone #361-252-6082 | | | | | |
| Precinct #1 | \$18.00/Ton (a) | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID |
| Precinct #1 Jobsite | \$19.50/Ton (a) | | | | |
| Precinct #2 | \$15.50/Ton (a) | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID |
| Precinct #2 Jobsite | \$17.00/Ton (a) | | | | |
| Precinct #3 | \$16.75/Ton (a) | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID |
| Precinct #3 Jobsite | \$18.75/Ton (a) | | | | |
| Precinct #4 | \$17.50/Ton (a) | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID |
| Precinct #4 Jobsite | \$19.50/Ton (a) | | | | |
| Note: Bid missing Conflict of Interest & Form 1295 | | | | | |
| | | | | | |
| | | | | | |
| Colorado Materials, LTD Phone #512-396-1555 | | | | | |
| Precinct #1 | NO BID | \$25.93/Ton (b) | NO BID | \$67.69/Ton (b) | NO BID |
| Precinct #2 | NO BID | \$23.50/Ton (b) | NO BID | \$64.69/Ton (b) | NO BID |
| Precinct #3 | NO BID | \$25.01/Ton (b) | NO BID | \$66.94/Ton (b) | NO BID |
| Precinct #4 | NO BID | \$25.64/Ton (b) | NO BID | \$62.50/Ton (b) | NO BID |
| Precinct #5 | NO BID | \$26.50/Ton (b) | NO BID | \$69.00/Ton (b) | NO BID |
| | | | | | |
| Quality Hot Mix, Inc. #979-543-4400 | | | | | |
| Precinct #1 | NO BID | \$26.00/Ton (c) | NO BID | \$59.00/Ton (c) | NO BID |
| Precinct #2 | NO BID | \$24.00/Ton (c) | NO BID | \$59.00/Ton (c) | NO BID |
| Precinct #3 | NO BID | \$25.50/Ton (c) | NO BID | \$59.00/Ton (c) | NO BID |
| Precinct #4 | NO BID | \$26.00/Ton (c) | NO BID | \$59.00/Ton (c) | NO BID |
| Jobsite as directed | NO BID | \$26.75/Ton (c) | NO BID | \$59.00/Ton (c) | NO BID |
| Note: All deliveries are in end dump trailers. Minimum load is 24 tons. Belly Dump Trailers can be requested & provided if available. | | | | | |
| | | | | | |
| | | | | | |
| Rexco, Inc. #361-552-5371 | | | | | |
| Precinct #1 | \$19.75/Ton (d) | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID |
| Precinct #1 Job Site | \$21.75/Ton (d) | | | | |
| Precinct #2 | \$18.00/Ton (d) | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID |
| Precinct #2 Job Site | \$19.00/Ton (d) | | | | |
| Precinct #3 | \$19.75/Ton (d) | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID |
| Precinct #3 Job Site | \$21.75/Ton (d) | | | | |
| Precinct #4 | \$19.75/Ton (d) | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID |
| Precinct #4 Job site | \$21.00/Ton (d) | | | | |
| Note: All prices subject to fuel surcharge based on diesel pricing at award of contract. Base diesel cost will be set at award date. | | | | | |
| Note: Bid missing Form 1295 - will provide if awarded | | | | | |
| | | | | | |
| Vulcan Construction Materials, LP Phone #210-965-0419 | | | | | |
| Precinct #1 | NO BID | \$45.69/Ton | NO BID | NO BID | \$77.20/Ton |
| Precinct #2 | NO BID | \$46.87/Ton | NO BID | NO BID | \$72.40/Ton |
| Precinct #3 | NO BID | \$45.00/Ton | NO BID | NO BID | \$74.80/Ton |
| Precinct #4 | NO BID | \$46.87/Ton | NO BID | NO BID | \$74.80/Ton |
| As Directed in County | NO BID | \$46.87/Ton | NO BID | NO BID | \$74.80/Ton |
| Note: Effective 3/1/22 will be implementing a trucking fuel surcharge. When price of on-road diesel surpasses \$3.24 on the EIA Fulg Coast PADD 3 index the freight rate will increase by 1% for every \$.05 move in the price of fuel, starting at \$3.25/gallon. The surcharge will be updated on the last Tuesday of every month. *see attached table* | | | | | |
| (a) Terms: Delivery in 2 days | | | | | |
| (b) Terms: 30 days, Delivery in 3 days | | | | | |
| (c) Terms: 30 days, Delivery in 2 days | | | | | |
| (d) Terms: 30 days, Delivery in 2 days | | | | | |